



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
215 West Garden Street
Pensacola, FL 32501

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
February 1, 2011

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
Condiments, Spices & Miscellaneous Foods, RFP
#111503

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

The bid is for a semi-annual pricing agreement to provide condiments, spices and miscellaneous foods (157 items bid; 100 recommended for award) as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and lunch menu requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications. The items not awarded are due to bidders bidding alternate products without providing samples, samples received not approved, products offered not meeting specifications, or District stock was not sufficiently depleted to warrant purchasing more stock during this bid period. The solicitation may be viewed at http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html.

Effective Dates: March 1, 2011 through October 31, 2011.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS:	ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Cheney Brothers, Inc., Ocala, FL	25	\$ 98,000.00
Dori Foods, Inc., Richmond, VA	10	33,600.00
Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV	3	10,000.00
JNS Foods, Inc., Tamarac, FL	1	3,000.00
Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL	28	91,700.00
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL	33	146,300.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

\$382,600.00 Est./6 Mos.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid

Responses Received: 8

Bids Rejected: 1

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

February 1, 2011, 10:40am CST

**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Boulevard
PENSACOLA, FL 32505
BID TABULATION**

DATE: January 11, 2011

Awarded Items are highlighted

BID NBR: 111503

BID TITLE: Condiments, Spices & Miscellaneous Foods

If 2 prices are listed, top price is vendor unit of purchase, i.e. case; bottom price is portion cost
Difference in Pack Size Requires Item to be awarded by portion cost

ITEM Quantity:	Vinegar, Apple Cider 50 gl 0501070	Black Olives, Sliced 100 cn 0502170	Banana Pepper Rings 75 gl 0502180	Jalapeno Peppers 25 cs 0502190
ITEM NUMBER	1	2	3	4
Cheney Brothers, Inc. Ocala, FL	2.5300	a	No Bid	No Bid
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	2.7950	a	6.7700	7.4000
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	11.18	u	40.62	29.60
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	6.1500		6.4900	6.8500
			38.95	27.40
				a
				4.4917
				a
				26.95

ITEM	Pickles, Sliced, Dill	gl	Kosher dill pickles, Whole	gl	Pickle relish, sweet	gl	Pickle relish, Dill	gl
Quantity:	96	cs	48	cs	50	cs	10	cs
	0502211		0502230		0502240		0502250	
ITEM NUMBER	5		6		7		8	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	4.9860		5.3450	a	5.9270		6.5850	
Ocala, FL	24.93		21.38	u	23.71		26.34	
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	3.4580	ap	4.4480	ap	5.4777		4.8550	
Elba, AL	17.29	u	22.24	u	21.91		19.42	
Kelley Foods of Alabama-AL	No Bid		No Bid		4.9850	a	NA	
Elba, AL					19.94	u		
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	4.5625		No Bid		5.4875		5.0750	
Geneva, AL	18.25				21.95		20.30	

Not Awarded

ITEM	Extract, Vanilla	gl	Marinara Sauce	10# cn	Croutons, Individual	25oz pk	Oil, Salad	cs
Quantity:	75	gl	200	cs	50	cs	75	cs
	0505110		0505200		0505240		0507011	
ITEM NUMBER	9		10		11		12	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	7.8950		4.6150		0.0707		No Bid	
Ocala, FL			27.69		17.68			
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		4.4810		No Bid		7.3680	a
Elba, AL			26.89				44.21	u
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	No Bid		4.3250		0.0634	a	7.5000	a
Geneva, AL			25.90		15.85	u	45.00	u

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Oil, Frying 1000 0507021	lb cs	Mayonnaise, Individual 1000 0507030	12 gm cs	Shortening, Solid 150 0507032	lb cs	Mayonnaise, Light 75 0507040	gl cs
Quantity:								
ITEM NUMBER	13		14		15		16	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		0.0396		1.1711		No Bid	
Ocala, FL			7.92		42.16			
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		0.0390		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL			7.80					
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		0.3975		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA			7.95					
Global Foods	No Bid		0.0376		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV			7.51					
Kelley Foods of Alabama	0.7674	a	0.0360		No Bid		7.4650	
Elba, AL	26.86	u	7.21				29.86	
Kelley Foods of Alabama -AL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		4.2220	a
Elba, AL							16.89	u
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	1.2857		0.0503		No Bid		5.9875	a
Geneva, AL	45.00		10.05				23.95	u

ITEM	Mayonnaise	gl cs	Mustard, Prepared 75 0507060	gl cs	Mustard 1000 0507070	ea cs	Mustard, Dry 20 0507072	lb cn
Quantity:								
ITEM NUMBER	17		18		19		20	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		3.7300		0.0159	a	8.8200	
Ocala, FL			14.92		3.18	u		
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		0.0150		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL					3.03			
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		0.0160		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV					3.25			
Kelley Foods of Alabama	5.1920	a	2.4150	a	0.0191	a	No Bid	
Elba, AL	20.77	u	9.66	u	3.83	u		
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	5.7125		3.4875		0.0169	ap	No Bid	
Geneva, AL	22.85		13.95		8.45	u		

ITEM	Barbeque Sauce		Vinegar, White		Worchestershire Sauce		Soy Sauce	
Quantity:	150	gl cs	100	gl	50	gl	25	gl
	0507080		0507110		0507120		0507130	
ITEM NUMBER	21		22		23		24	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	7.9550		2.5500		7.4600		7.9000	
Ocala, FL	31.82							
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	6.5820		2.3225		3.8475	a	2.7950	a
Elba, AL	26.33		9.29		15.39	u	11.18	u
Kelley Foods of Alabama -AL	4.0450	a	1.5525	a	2.6400	a	No Bid	
Elba, AL	16.18	u	6.21	u	10.56	u		
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	7.4500		2.6067	a	5.7375		8.7250	
Geneva, AL	29.80			u				

ITEM	Dressing, Creamy Italian		Dressing, Ranch, 3.2oz		Dressing, Lo Cal Italian, 3.2oz		Dressing, Ranch Individual	
Quantity:	75	cs	100	ea cs	100	cs	900	pk cs
	0507140		0507150		0507160		0507180	
ITEM NUMBER	25		26		27		28	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		1.2600		No Bid		0.0402	
Ocala, FL			22.70				8.04	
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.0366	a
Tamarac, FL							7.32	u
Dori Foods, Inc.	1.2917	a	0.9772	a	0.9570		No Bid	
Richmond, VA	23.25	u	17.59	u	17.23			
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		1.1260		No Bid		0.1790	ap
Elba, AL			20.27				10.74	u
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	No Bid		1.4125		No Bid		0.1825	ap
Geneva, AL			16.95				10.95	u

Not Awarded

ITEM	Dressing, Italian		Hot Sauce		Honey Mustard,		Dressing, non-fat	
Quantity:	Individual	ea	Individual	ea	Individual	ea	Individual	ea
	300	cs	150	cs	100	cs	200	cs
	0507190		0507200		0507210		0507230	
ITEM NUMBER	29		30		31		32	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	0.1133	ap	0.0508		0.0508		0.1368	
Ocala, FL	6.80	u	10.16		11.60		8.21	
JNS Foods, LLC	0.0286	ap	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL	5.72	u						
Dori Foods, Inc.	0.1208	ap	No Bid		No Bid		0.1698	a
Richmond, VA	7.25	u					10.19	u
Global Foods	No Bid		0.0470		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV			9.40					
Kelley Foods of Alabama	0.1188	ap	0.0510		0.0997	a	No Bid	
Elba, AL	7.13	u	10.27		9.97	u		
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	0.1217	ap	0.0488		0.1925	a	0.1659	
Geneva, AL	7.30	u	9.75		19.25	u	9.95	

Not Awarded

ITEM	Dressing, French		Dressing, Thousand		Soy Sauce		Duck Sauce	
Quantity:	Individual	ea	Island	ea	Individual	cs	Individual	cs
	100	cs	150	cs	100	cs	75	cs
	0507240		0507260		0507270		0507280	
ITEM NUMBER	33		34		35		36	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	0.0380		0.0379		0.0190	m	0.0215	m
Ocala, FL	7.59		7.58		9.50	u	10.75	u
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL								
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	0.0698		0.0743		0.0393	a	No Bid	
Geneva, AL	13.95		14.85		7.85			

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Orange Sauce 100 gl cs 0507290	Chinese Hot Mustard, Ind. 75 cs 0507300	Tartar Sauce Individual 100 ea cs 0507320	BBQ Sauce, Individual 250 ea cs 0507320			
ITEM NUMBER	37	38	39	40			
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid	0.0215	m	No Bid	0.0298		
Ocala, FL		10.75	u		5.95		
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		
Tamarac, FL							
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		
Richmond, VA							
Global Foods	No Bid	No Bid		0.0410	No Bid		
Las Vegas, NV				8.12	u		
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid	No Bid		0.0380	a	0.0310	a
Elba, AL				7.65	u	6.21	u
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN							
Sysco Gulf Coast	8.0875	No Bid		0.0705	a	0.0605	
Geneva, AL	32.35			14.10	u	12.10	

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat 200 ea cs 0507330	Dressing, Chipotle 52 gl 0507340	Salsa Individual 300 ea cs 0507350	Dressing, Caesar, pouch 75 ea cs 0509000	
ITEM NUMBER	41	42	43	44	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.1890	ap
Ocala, FL				11.35	u
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid	No Bid	0.0286	No Bid	
Tamarac, FL			5.72		
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.1150	ap
Richmond, VA				11.15	u
Global Foods	No Bid	No Bid	0.0280	No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV			5.59		
Kelley Foods of Alabama	0.0633	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Elba, AL	12.69				
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Marshall, MN					
Sysco Gulf Coast	0.0760	No Bid	0.0693	0.2400	ap
Geneva, AL	15.20		13.85	14.40	u

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Coffee Creamer, Fr. Vanilla	Coffee, Cold	Peanuts, Salted	1oz ea	Coffee, Whole Bean
Quantity:	20 cs	50 cs	20 cs		20 cs
	0512130	0512140	0512160		0512190
ITEM NUMBER	45	46	47		48
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	0.0605	No Bid	0.2304		No Bid
Ocala, FL	10.90		33.18		
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
Tamarac, FL					
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
Richmond, VA					
Global Foods	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
Las Vegas, NV					
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
Elba, AL					
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
Marshall, MN					
Sysco Gulf Coast	0.0589	No Bid	0.1914		No Bid
Geneva, AL	16.95		27.55		

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Half & Half, Individual	3/8 oz	Sweet and Sour Sauce	Alfredo Sauce, Frozen	White Pepper
Quantity:	20 cs		200 cs	200 cs	75 lb
	0512210		0513200	0513220	0502090
ITEM NUMBER	49		50	51	52
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	0.0648		No Bid	36.9000	No Bid
Ocala, FL	11.67				
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tamarac, FL					
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	5.3500
Richmond, VA					
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Las Vegas, NV					
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		0.0956	No Bid	No Bid
Elba, AL			9.56		
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Marshall, MN					
Sysco Gulf Coast	No Bid		0.1495	34.2000	No Bid
Geneva, AL			14.95		

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Onions		Meat Base, Beef		Chicken Base		Ham Base	
Quantity:	75	lb cs	75	5lb ea	200	5lb ea	75	ea
ITEM NUMBER	53		54		55		56	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	3.5760		9.9000	ap	8.9000	ap	No Bid	
Ocala, FL	64.37			u	8.90	u		
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	1.7633		11.0000		12.0000		No Bid	
Richmond, VA	26.45		44.00		48.00			
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	3.1730		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL	47.60							
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	No Bid		16.9750		16.9750		4.5834	
Geneva, AL			67.90		67.90		55.00	

ITEM	Coloring, Yellow		Coloring, Green		Coloring, Red		Red Pepper, Crushed	
Quantity:	25	qt	50	pt	50	qt	50	cs
ITEM NUMBER	57		58		59		60	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Ocala, FL								
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	4.4100	a	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL	52.96	u						
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Geneva, AL								

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Chili Powder, Dark	Cinnamon, Ground	Creole Seasoning	Cumin, Ground
Quantity:	150 cn 0510220	50 cn 0510250	30 cn 0510260	100 cn 0510310
ITEM NUMBER	61	62	63	64
Cheney Brothers, Inc. Ocala, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	No Bid	4.5050 a 27.03 u	No Bid	7.5400
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Garlic, Granulated	Kitchen Bouquet	Oregano, Ground	Paprika, Ground
Quantity:	300 cn 0510340	50 qt 0510430	50 cn 0510602	50 cn 0510630
ITEM NUMBER	65	66	67	68
Cheney Brothers, Inc. Ocala, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	5.0000	6.3330	No Bid	No Bid
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Pepper, Black, Ground 200 0510690	cn	Pepper, Black Ground, Ind. 50 0510721	1000 cs	Poultry Seasoning 50 0510750	cn	Salt 120 0510780	26oz pk cs
ITEM NUMBER	69		70		71		72	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		2.7930		No Bid		0.6658	
Ocala, FL			8.38				15.98	
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	6.3400		2.5533		8.7900		0.4080	
Elba, AL	38.04		7.66		52.74		9.80	
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.5063	a
Geneva, AL							12.15	u

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Salt, Individual 100 0510800	3000 cs	Hot Sauce 75 0510850	12 oz cs	Bacon Ends & Pieces 400 0516160	lb	Lemon Juice 100 0503020	oz gl
ITEM NUMBER	73		74		75		76	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	6.0000		5.5500		2.1000	a	0.1018	ap
Ocala, FL			66.64			u	4.89	u
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	5.1700		No Bid		No Bid		0.0284	a
Elba, AL							14.55	u
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	11.8500		4.8209		1.5000	a	0.0524	a
Geneva, AL			57.85			u	26.85	u

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Tea		Baking		Baking		Chocolate	
Quantity:	Bags	ea	Powder	lb	Soda	lb	Chips	lb
	100	cs	250	cn	30	cs	100	cs
	0503040		0505011		0505020		0505030	
ITEM NUMBER	77		78		79		80	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		0.5783		2.2350	
Ocala, FL					13.88		55.88	
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	0.0978		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA	9.39							
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	0.1100		7.6820		0.5750		No Bid	
Elba, AL	11.00		46.09		13.80			
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	0.2407		7.3250	a	0.5355		1.9560	
Geneva, AL	23.10		43.95	u	12.85		48.90	

ITEM	Cocoa		Corn		Flour,		Flour,	
Quantity:	lb		Starch	lb	All Purpose	lb	Whole Wheat	lb
	50	bx	10	cs	1100	bg	75	bg
	0505040		0505080		0505180		0505190	
ITEM NUMBER	81		82		83		84	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		0.8075		No Bid		No Bid	
Ocala, FL			19.38					
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		0.7360		No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL			17.67					
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	5.0000		No Bid		0.3100		0.3990	
Geneva, AL	25.00				15.50		19.95	

ITEM	Fettuccine Noodles	lb	Milk, Non-fat, dry	lb	Graham Snacks	cs	Fruit Snacks	cs
Quantity:	150	cs	75	bg	100	cs	200	cs
	0505210		0505211		0505250		0505260	
ITEM NUMBER	85		86		87		88	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Ocala, FL								
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid			a	No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL			80.72	u				
Dori Foods, Inc.	0.6350	a	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA	12.70							
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL								
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	0.9550	a	2.5000	a	No Bid		No Bid	
Geneva, AL	19.10	u	75.00	u				

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Oats	42 oz	Hominy Grits	lb	Cornmeal	lb	Macaroni, Elbow	lb
Quantity:	50	cs	100	cs	100	cs	350	cs
	0506121		0506130		0506141		0508011	
ITEM NUMBER	89		90		91		92	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	2.1140		0.4947		No Bid		No Bid	
Ocala, FL	25.27		19.79					
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.6350	a
Richmond, VA							12.70	u
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	2.0220		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL	24.27							
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	2.4959		0.4275		0.3588	a	0.9125	
Geneva, AL	29.95		17.10		14.35	u	18.25	

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Macaroni, Elbow Whole Grain 60 cs	Lasagna lb 30 cs 0508030	Spaghetti, Thin lb 250 cs 0508041	Spaghetti, Thin Whole Grain 60 cs
ITEM NUMBER	93	94	95	96
Cheney Brothers, Inc. Ocala, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	0.6350 12.70	a No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid	1.3292 15.95	0.8875 17.75	No Bid

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Rice lb 150 bg 0508061	Rice, Seasoned Yellow lb 50 cs 0508070	Rice, Brown lb 50 bg 0508090	Rice, Sticky lb 800 bg 0508100
ITEM NUMBER	97	98	99	100
Cheney Brothers, Inc. Ocala, FL	No Bid	2.0700 24.84	No Bid	0.9272 23.18
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	0.8210 20.54	a 2.3640 u 23.64	a 1.0330 u 25.83	No Bid
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	0.4790 23.95	a 2.0531 u 31.70	a 0.6220 u 15.55	No Bid

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Jambalaya Rice 50 0508080	lb cs	Asian Noodles, Crispy 50 0508110	1oz cn cs	Coconut Flakes 25 0509010	lb cs	Gelatin, Blue 100 0509031	4.5 lb cs
ITEM NUMBER	101		102		103		104	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		0.9900	m	No Bid		5.5000	m
Ocala, FL			15.95	u			33.00	u
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		No Bid		1.6700		No Bid	
Elba, AL					16.70			
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	2.3425		0.0258		1.9500	a	6.3330	
Geneva, AL	46.85		24.80	bulk	19.50	u	38.00	

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Gelatin, Lime 50 0509040	4.5 lb cs	Gelatin, Orange 50 0509050	4.5 lb cs	Gelatin, Strawberry 175 0509060	4.5 lb cs	Pudding & Pie, Chocolate 75 0509090	oz cs
ITEM NUMBER	105		106		107		108	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	5.5000	m	5.5000	m	5.5000	m	0.0785	m
Ocala, FL	33.00	u	33.00	u	33.00	u	26.37	u
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL								
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	6.3333		6.3333		6.3333		0.0842	a
Geneva, AL	38.00		38.00		38.00		24.25	u

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Pudding & Pie, 24	Syrup,	Honey	Jelly
Quantity:	Vanilla oz	Individual ea	lb	cn
	25 cs	1200 cs	50 cs	50 cs
	0509100	0511020	0511041	0511050
ITEM NUMBER	109	110	111	112
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	1.9208 m	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Ocala, FL	23.05 u			
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid	0.0607	No Bid	No Bid
Tamarac, FL		6.07		
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid	0.0745 a	No Bid	6.0000
Richmond, VA		7.45 u		36.00
Global Foods	No Bid	0.0603	No Bid	No Bid
Las Vegas, NV		6.03		
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid	0.0635	No Bid	8.2400
Elba, AL		6.35		49.46
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Marshall, MN				
Sysco Gulf Coast	1.9250 a	0.1295 ap	2.6650 a	6.3750 a
Geneva, AL	23.10 u	12.95 u	79.95 u	38.25 u

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Sugar, Confectioners lb	Sugar, Light Brown lb	Sugar, Granulated lb	Sweetner, Artificial ea
Quantity:	200 cs	200 cs	500 bg	20 cs
	0511121	0511161	0511170	0511182
ITEM NUMBER	113	114	115	116
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Ocala, FL				
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tamarac, FL				
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Richmond, VA				
Global Foods	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Las Vegas, NV				
Kelley Foods of Alabama	0.9854	0.9854	0.6386	0.0097 a
Elba, AL	23.65	23.65	31.93	19.57 u
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Marshall, MN				
Sysco Gulf Coast	1.0230	1.0230	0.6800 a	0.0093
Geneva, AL	24.55	24.55	34.00 u	18.45

ITEM Quantity:	Cream of Chicken 30 0512040	cn cs	Cream of Mushroom 30 0512050	cn cs	Peanut Butter 50 0512171	cn cs	Whipped Topping 50 0513051	lb cs
ITEM NUMBER	117		118		119		120	
Cheney Brothers, Inc. Ocala, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		2.2500 27.00	
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	2.7999 33.59		2.7710 33.26		6.0680 36.41	a u	2.2640 27.17	a u
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	3.0584 36.75		3.0584 36.70		6.1584 36.95	a u	2.1375 25.65	

Not Awarded

ITEM Quantity:	Margarine 1200 0516370	cs	Fortune Cookie 150 0502390	ea cs	Crackers, Cheddar, 3/4oz 75 0505090	pk cs	"Moon Pie" Sandwich 350 0505120	ea cs
ITEM NUMBER	121		122		123		124	
Cheney Brothers, Inc. Ocala, FL	No Bid		0.0420 21.00		No Bid		No Bid	
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	21.3300	a u	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid		0.0528 19.80	a u	No Bid		No Bid	
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid		0.0378 15.10	a u	0.1400 42.00		0.1664 24.95	

Not Awarded

ITEM	Graham Cracker	Crackers,	2	Crackers,	2	Taco	
Quantity:	Crumbs lb	Capt. Wafers	pk	Saltine	pk	Shell	
	20 bx	150 cs		350 cs		450 cs	
	0505140	0512020		0512030		0512070	
ITEM NUMBER	125	126		127		128	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Ocala, FL							
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL							
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA							
Global Foods	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV							
Kelley Foods of Alabama	1.9390	0.0277		0.0207		0.0722	
Elba, AL	19.39	13.85		10.35		14.44	
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN							
Sysco Gulf Coast	1.7350	a 0.0297		0.0224		0.0688	
Geneva, AL	17.35	u 14.85		11.20		13.75	

Not Awarded

ITEM	Pretzels,	Bake & Serve	Cookie,	Cookie,
Quantity:	Soft Jumbo ea	Apple Pie	Choc. Chip ea	Dbl. Choc. ea
	100 cs	100 cs	100 cs	100 cs
	0517050	0517061	0517080	0517110
ITEM NUMBER	129	130	131	132
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	0.1737	0.1737
Ocala, FL			41.70	41.70
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Tamarac, FL				
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Richmond, VA				
Global Foods	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Las Vegas, NV				
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Elba, AL				
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Marshall, MN				
Sysco Gulf Coast	0.4750	No Bid	0.2369	No Bid
Geneva, AL	22.85		56.85	

Not Awarded

ITEM	Cookie, Carnival ea Quantity: 100 cs 0517120	Cookie, S'mores ea 100 cs 0517130	Cookie, Macadamia ea 100 cs 0517150	Cookie, Choc. Pecan ea 100 cs 0517330
ITEM NUMBER	133	134	135	136
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	0.1737	0.1903	0.1903	0.1737
Ocala, FL	41.70	45.66	45.66	41.70
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid	No Bid	0.2536 60.85	0.2373 56.95

ITEM	Cookie, Cran- berry Oat. ea Quantity: 100 cs 0517380	Cookie, Oatmeal Rasin ea 100 cs 0517370	Cookies, Candy, PB ea 100 cs 0517340	Cookie, Strawberry ea 100 cs 0517360
ITEM NUMBER	137	138	139	140
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	0.1903	0.1737	0.1737	0.1903
Ocala, FL	45.66	41.70	41.70	45.66
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid	0.2373 56.95	0.2373 56.95	0.2584 62.00

ITEM	Cookie, Car/Choc Chips, Pecans ea 100 cs 0517350	Muffin, Variety ea 300 cs 0517170	Biscuits, Frozen ea 1200 cs 0517300	Biscuits, Frozen Whole Grain ea 200 cs 0517290
Quantity:				
ITEM NUMBER	141	142	143	144
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	0.1903	0.4843	0.1040	0.1140
Ocala, FL	45.66	23.25	22.90	25.10
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	No Bid	No Bid	0.1011 22.25	0.1110 24.50
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid	0.8355 20.05	0.1044 22.95	0.1148 25.25

ITEM	Soy Milk 1/2 pint 12000 pt	Soy Milk 1/2 gallon 1600 ea	Pizza, Turkey Sau. 5 600 oz 0516790 N	Sushi, California Roll 1200 ea
Quantity:				
ITEM NUMBER	145	146	147	148
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	0.4770 a	No Bid
Ocala, FL			34.40 u	
JNS Foods, LLC Tamarac, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dori Foods, Inc. Richmond, VA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Global Foods Las Vegas, NV	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kelley Foods of Alabama Elba, AL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Marshall, MN	No Bid	No Bid	0.3655 a 29.24 u	No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast Geneva, AL	No Bid	No Bid	0.4875 a 35.10 u	No Bid

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Potato Chunks	lb cs	Potatoes, Instant	lb cs	Chili Fiesta Stix	cs	Peas, Green	lb cs
Quantity:	500	N	500	0502290	2100	0516510	600	0514301
ITEM NUMBER	149		150		151		152	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Ocala, FL								
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		1.1210		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA			36.99					
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		5.8580	m	No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL			35.15	u				
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	1.6670	a	1.2867	a	No Bid		0.8584	
Geneva, AL	35.00	u	41.00	u			25.75	

Not Awarded

Not Awarded

ITEM	Waffle	ea cs	Bologna	lb	Chicken, Diced, Frozen	lb cs	String Cheese, Low Fat, Mozz	cs
Quantity:	500		1000		200		150	
	0517021		0516010		0516571		0517030	
ITEM NUMBER	153		154		155		156	
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		0.2671	
Ocala, FL							44.88	
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Tamarac, FL								
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Richmond, VA								
Global Foods	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Las Vegas, NV								
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Elba, AL								
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Marshall, MN								
Sysco Gulf Coast	0.4216		1.6200		2.7550		0.2084	
Geneva, AL	30.35				27.55		35.00	

ITEM	Mozzarella Cheese						
Quantity:	4000 lb						
	0516361						
ITEM NUMBER	157						
Cheney Brothers, Inc.	No Bid						
Ocala, FL							
JNS Foods, LLC	No Bid						
Tamarac, FL							
Dori Foods, Inc.	No Bid						
Richmond, VA							
Global Foods	No Bid						
Las Vegas, NV							
Kelley Foods of Alabama	No Bid						
Elba, AL							
Schwan's Food Service, Inc.	No Bid						
Marshall, MN							
Sysco Gulf Coast	No Bid						
Geneva, AL							

Not Awarded

NOTES:

a = Alternate Product Bid

m = Bidder has Minimum Shipment Requirement

u = No sample received; did not meet specifications or sample was not approved

p = Pack size does not meet specifications

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST:

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing also posted to the School

<http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/>

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in

Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.

Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie

Director

Director